
 
 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Title 11—DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

Division 45—Missouri Gaming Commission
 

Chapter 4—Licenses
 

ORDER OF RULEMAKING 


By the authority vested in the Missouri Gaming Commission under section 313.805, RSMo 
Supp. 2016, the commission rescinds a rule as follows: 

11 CSR 45-4.070 Competitiveness Standards is rescinded. 

A notice of proposed rulemaking containing the text of the proposed rescission was published in 
the Missouri Register on January 16, 2018 (43 MoReg 48). No changes have been made to the 
text of the proposed rescission, so it is not reprinted here. This proposed rescission becomes 
effective thirty (30) days after publication in the Code of State Regulations. 

SUMMARY OF COMMENTS: A public hearing was held on this proposed rescission on 
February 20, 2018. No one commented on this proposed rescission at the public hearing, and no 
written comments were received. 



 
 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Title 11—DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

Division 45—Missouri Gaming Commission
 

Chapter 4—Licenses
 

ORDER OF RULEMAKING 


By the authority vested in the Missouri Gaming Commission under section 313.805, RSMo 
Supp. 2016, the commission rescinds a rule as follows: 

11 CSR 45-4.430 Waiver of Requirements is rescinded. 

A notice of proposed rulemaking containing the text of the proposed rescission was published in 
the Missouri Register on January 16, 2018 (43 MoReg 49). No changes have been made to the 
text of the proposed rescission, so it is not reprinted here. This proposed rescission becomes 
effective thirty (30) days after publication in the Code of State Regulations. 

SUMMARY OF COMMENTS: A public hearing was held on this proposed rescission on 
February 20, 2018. No one commented on this proposed rescission at the public hearing, and no 
written comments were received. 



 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Title 11—DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

Division 45—Missouri Gaming Commission
 

Chapter 5—Conduct of Gaming 


ORDER OF RULEMAKING 


By the authority vested in the Missouri Gaming Commission under section 313.805, RSMo 
Supp. 2016, the commission rescinds a rule as follows: 

11 CSR 45-5.280 Forfeiture of Illegal Winnings is rescinded. 

A notice of proposed rulemaking containing the text of the proposed rescission was published in 
the Missouri Register on January 16, 2018 (43 MoReg 49–50). No changes have been made to 
the text of the proposed rescission, so it is not reprinted here. This proposed rescission becomes 
effective thirty (30) days after publication in the Code of State Regulations. 

SUMMARY OF COMMENTS: A public hearing was held on this proposed rescission on 
February 20, 2018. No one commented on this proposed rescission at the public hearing, and no 
written comments were received. 



 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Title 11—DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

Division 45—Missouri Gaming Commission
 

Chapter 6—Operation of the Riverboat 


ORDER OF RULEMAKING 


By the authority vested in the Missouri Gaming Commission under section 313.805, RSMo 
Supp. 2016, the commission rescinds a rule as follows: 

11 CSR 45-6.050 Limited License is rescinded. 

A notice of proposed rulemaking containing the text of the proposed rescission was published in 
the Missouri Register on January 16, 2018 (43 MoReg 50–51). No changes have been made to 
the text of the proposed rescission, so it is not reprinted here. This proposed rescission becomes 
effective thirty (30) days after publication in the Code of State Regulations. 

SUMMARY OF COMMENTS: A public hearing was held on this proposed rescission on 
February 20, 2018. No one commented on this proposed rescission at the public hearing, and no 
written comments were received. 



 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Title 11—DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

Division 45—Missouri Gaming Commission
 

Chapter 7--Security and Surveillance 


ORDER OF RULEMAKING 


By the authority vested in the Missouri Gaming Commission under section 313.805, RSMo 
Supp. 2016, the commission rescinds a rule as follows: 

11 CSR 45-7.140 Requests for Exemptions is rescinded. 

A notice of proposed rulemaking containing the text of the proposed rescission was published in 
the Missouri Register on January 16, 2018 (43 MoReg 51). No changes have been made to the 
text of the proposed rescission, so it is not reprinted here. This proposed rescission becomes 
effective thirty (30) days after publication in the Code of State Regulations. 

SUMMARY OF COMMENTS: A public hearing was held on this proposed rescission on 
February 20, 2018. No one commented on this proposed rescission at the public hearing, and no 
written comments were received. 



 

 
 

 

 

 

 
 

Title 11—DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

Division 45—Missouri Gaming Commission
 

Chapter 8—Accounting Records and 

Procedures; Audits
 

ORDER OF RULEMAKING 


By the authority vested in the Missouri Gaming Commission under section 313.805, RSMo 
Supp. 2016, the commission rescinds a rule as follows: 

11 CSR 45-8.160 Extension of Time for Reporting is rescinded. 

A notice of proposed rulemaking containing the text of the proposed rescission was published in 
the Missouri Register on January 16, 2018 (43 MoReg 51–52). No changes have been made to 
the text of the proposed rescission, so it is not reprinted here. This proposed rescission becomes 
effective thirty (30) days after publication in the Code of State Regulations. 

SUMMARY OF COMMENTS: A public hearing was held on this proposed rescission on 
February 20, 2018. No one commented on this proposed rescission at the public hearing, and no 
written comments were received. 



 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Title 11—DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

Division 45—Missouri Gaming Commission
 

Chapter 10—Licensee’s Responsibilities 


ORDER OF RULEMAKING 


By the authority vested in the Missouri Gaming Commission under section 313.805, RSMo 
Supp. 2016, the commission rescinds a rule as follows: 

11 CSR 45-10.070 Effect of Another Jurisdiction’s Orders is rescinded. 

A notice of proposed rulemaking containing the text of the proposed rescission was published in 
the Missouri Register on January 16, 2018 (43 MoReg 52). No changes have been made to the 
text of the proposed rescission, so it is not reprinted here. This proposed rescission becomes 
effective thirty (30) days after publication in the Code of State Regulations. 

SUMMARY OF COMMENTS: A public hearing was held on this proposed rescission on 
February 20, 2018. No one commented on this proposed rescission at the public hearing, and no 
written comments were received. 



 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Title 11—DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

Division 45—Missouri Gaming Commission
 

Chapter 10—Licensee’s Responsibilities 


ORDER OF RULEMAKING 


By the authority vested in the Missouri Gaming Commission under section 313.805, RSMo 
Supp. 2016, the commission rescinds a rule as follows: 

11 CSR 45-10.115 List of Barred Persons is rescinded. 

A notice of proposed rulemaking containing the text of the proposed rescission was published in 
the Missouri Register on January 16, 2018 (43 MoReg 52). No changes have been made to the 
text of the proposed rescission, so it is not reprinted here. This proposed rescission becomes 
effective thirty (30) days after publication in the Code of State Regulations. 

SUMMARY OF COMMENTS: A public hearing was held on this proposed rescission on 
February 20, 2018. No one commented on this proposed rescission at the public hearing, and no 
written comments were received. 



 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Title 11—DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

Division 45—Missouri Gaming Commission
 

Chapter 11—Taxation Regulations 


ORDER OF RULEMAKING 


By the authority vested in the Missouri Gaming Commission under section 313.805, RSMo 
Supp. 2016, the commission rescinds a rule as follows: 

11 CSR 45-11.170 Exemptions is rescinded. 

A notice of proposed rulemaking containing the text of the proposed rescission was published in 
the Missouri Register on January 16, 2018 (43 MoReg 52–53). No changes have been made to 
the text of the proposed rescission, so it is not reprinted here. This proposed rescission becomes 
effective thirty (30) days after publication in the Code of State Regulations. 

SUMMARY OF COMMENTS: A public hearing was held on this proposed rescission on 
February 20, 2018. No one commented on this proposed rescission at the public hearing, and no 
written comments were received. 



 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Title 11—DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

Division 45—Missouri Gaming Commission
 

Chapter 11—Taxation Regulations 


ORDER OF RULEMAKING 


By the authority vested in the Missouri Gaming Commission under section 313.805, RSMo 
Supp. 2016, the commission rescinds a rule as follows: 

11 CSR 45-11.180 Estoppel is rescinded. 

A notice of proposed rulemaking containing the text of the proposed rescission was published in 
the Missouri Register on January 16, 2018 (43 MoReg 53). No changes have been made to the 
text of the proposed rescission, so it is not reprinted here. This proposed rescission becomes 
effective thirty (30) days after publication in the Code of State Regulations. 

SUMMARY OF COMMENTS: A public hearing was held on this proposed rescission on 
February 20, 2018. No one commented on this proposed rescission at the public hearing, and no 
written comments were received. 



 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Title 11—DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

Division 45—Missouri Gaming Commission
 

Chapter 30— Bingo 


ORDER OF RULEMAKING 


By the authority vested in the Missouri Gaming Commission under section 313.805, RSMo 
Supp. 2016, the commission rescinds a rule as follows: 

11 CSR 45-30.500 Bingo on Military Installations is rescinded. 

A notice of proposed rulemaking containing the text of the proposed rescission was published in 
the Missouri Register on January 16, 2018 (43 MoReg 57). No changes have been made to the 
text of the proposed rescission, so it is not reprinted here. This proposed rescission becomes 
effective thirty (30) days after publication in the Code of State Regulations. 

SUMMARY OF COMMENTS: A public hearing was held on this proposed rescission on 
February 20, 2018. No one commented on this proposed rescission at the public hearing, and no 
written comments were received. 



 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Title 11—DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

Division 45—Missouri Gaming Commission
 

Chapter 31— Hearings 


ORDER OF RULEMAKING 


By the authority vested in the Missouri Gaming Commission under section 313.805, RSMo 
Supp. 2016, the commission rescinds a rule as follows: 

11 CSR 45-31.005 Procedures for Disciplinary Actions and Hearings is rescinded. 

A notice of proposed rulemaking containing the text of the proposed rescission was published in 
the Missouri Register on January 16, 2018 (43 MoReg 57). No changes have been made to the 
text of the proposed rescission, so it is not reprinted here. This proposed rescission becomes 
effective thirty (30) days after publication in the Code of State Regulations. 

SUMMARY OF COMMENTS: A public hearing was held on this proposed rescission on 
February 20, 2018. No one commented on this proposed rescission at the public hearing, and no 
written comments were received. 
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